Costa, Michael

From: Costa, Michael

Sent: : Thursday, October 02, 2014 2:43 PM
To: ‘Jon Gruber

Subject: RE: revised invoice

Thanks. Please confirm that by mid July you mean the date the contract started, July 21st.
A simple yes via email is fine.

Best,
Michael

————— Original Message-----

From: Jon Gruber [mailto:gruberj@mit.edu]
Sent: Tuesday, September 38, 2014 5:88 PM
To: Costa, Michael

Subject: revised invoice

thanks Michael!

Jonathan Gruber

Ford Professor of Economics

MIT Department of Economics

48 Ames Street, E17-220

Cambridge, MA 82139

phone: 617-253-8892

fax: 617-253-1339

e-mail: gruberi@mit.edu

web: http://econ-www.mit.edu/faculty/sruberi/




Costa, Michael

From: Costa, Michael

Sent: Thursday, October 02, 2014 3:30 PM
To: Clasen, Michael

Subject: Fwd: revised invoice

See below. This should be enough to approve the invoice.
Sent from my tPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jon Gruber <gruberi(@mit.edis>

Date: October 2, 2014 at 2:44:41 PM EDT

To: "Costa, Michael" <Michaecl.Costa@state,vt.us>
Subject: Re: revised invoice

yes, that is right
On 10/2/2014 2:43 PM, Costa, Michael wrote:

Thanks. Please confirm that by mid July you mean the date the contract started, July 21st. A
simple yes via email s fine.

Best,
Michael

-----Original Message-----

From: Jon Gruber [mailto:gruberi@mit.edu]
Sent: Tuesday, September 30, 2014 5:00 PM
To: Costa, Michael |

Subject: revised invoice

thanks Michael!

Jonathan Gruber

Ford Professor of Economics
MIT Department of Economics
40 Ames Street, E17-220
Cambridge, MA 02139

phone: 617-253-8892

fax: 617-253-1330



e-mail: eruberif@mit.edu
web: httn://econ-www.mit.edu/Taculty/eruberi/




Costa, Michael

From: Clasen, Michael

Sent: Thursday, October 02, 2014 3:31 PM
To: Costa, Michael

Subject: RE: revised invoice

THX

From: Costa, Michael

Sent: Thursday, October 02, 2014 3;30 PM
To: Clasen, Michael

Subject: Fwd: revised invoice

See below. This should be enough to approve the invoice.
Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: Jon Gruber <gruberj@mit.edu>

Date: October 2, 2014 at 2:44:41 PM EDT

To: "Costa, Michael" <Michael. Costai@state, vt us>
Subject: Re: revised invoice

yes, that is right
On 10/2/2014 2:43 PM, Costa, Michael wrote:

Thanks. Please confirm that by mid July you mean the date the contract started, July 21st. A
simple yes via email is fine.

Best,
Michael

-----QOriginal Message-----

From: Jon Gruber [mailto:gruberi@mit.edu)|
Sent: Tuesday, September 30, 2014 5:00 PM
To: Costa, Michael

Subject: revised invoice

thanks Michaell

Jonathan Gruber



Ford Professor of Economics
.MIT Department of Economics

40 Ames Street, E17-220

Cambridge, MA 02139

phone: 617-253-8892

fax: 617-253-1330

e-mail: gruberj@mit.edu

web: hitp//econ-www.mit.edu/faculty/cruberj/






